

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2018

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP I		CL S Sewer Equipment Co., Inc. 726 S. Sherman St. Richardson, TX 75081	Kinloch Equipment & Supply, Inc. 3816 Binz Engleman, B101 San Antonio, TX 78219 Pasadena, TX 77503	Enz USA, Inc. 1585 Beverly Ct - Unit 115 Aurora, IL 60502	Aries Industries, Inc.
1.	Sewer Cleaning Nozzles 15 ea. Standard Nozzle, 1" connection, for 6" to 14" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 2.37" diameter x 3.28" long, weight to be 1.67 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 8 thrust jets (at 30 degrees) and 1 front jet. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 30.100 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34718) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE 423.00 TOTAL Make/Model 6,345.00 Enz 30.100	437.10 6,556.50 Enz 30.100	470.00 7,050.00	NO BID
2.	15 ea. psi, dimensions to be 3.11" diameter x 5.35" long, weight to be 10 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 10 thrust jets (5 at 10 degrees, 5 at 30 degrees). Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 40.100A or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34719) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE 936.00 TOTAL Make/Model 14,040.00 Enz 40.100A	967.20 14,508.00 Enz 40.100A	1,040.00 15,600.00	
3.	10 ea. Chisel-Point Nozzle, 1" connection, for 6" to 16" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 2.67" diameter x 7.28" long, weight to be 5.73 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 4 front penetrating jets(3 at 15 degrees and 1 at 0 degrees) and 6 thrust jets (at 20 degrees). Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 60.100L or approved equal Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE 1,206.00 TOTAL Make/Model 12,060.00 Enz 60.100L	460.35 4,603.50 Enz 460.100L	1,340.00 13,400.00	
4.	10 ea. KBR Rotating Combination Nozzle, 1" connection, for 4" to 12" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 2.4" diameter x 4.4" long, weight to be 3.5 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 4 rotating jets (2 at 90 degrees and 2 at 45 degrees) and 3 thrust jets. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 04.060 or approved equal Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE 949.50 TOTAL Make/Model 9,495.00 Enz 04.060	981.15 9,811.50 Enz 04.060	1,055.00 10,550.00	
5.	15 ea. Standard Penetrator Nozzle, 1" connection, for 4" to 12" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 2.37" diameter x 3.28" long, weight to be 1.67 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 4 front penetrating jets (at 15 degrees) and 8 thrust jets (at 30 degrees). Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 35.100 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34722) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE 522.00 TOTAL Make/Model 7,830.00 Enz 35.100	539.40 8,091.00 Enz 35.100	580.00 8,700.00	
6.	2 ea. Enz Model # 01.100A or approved equal - RGS Radially Rotating Nozzle, 1" connection, for 8" to 24" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 4" diameter x 7.1" long, weight to be 16.3 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 4 rotating jets (at 80 degrees) and 3 optional thrust jets. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 01.100A or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34723) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE 2,277.00 TOTAL Make/Model 4,554.00 Enz 01.100A	2,352.90 4,705.80 Enz 01.100A	2,530.00 5,060.00	

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2018

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	CL S Sewer Equipment Co., Inc. 726 S. Sherman St. Richardson, TX 75081	Kinloch Equipment & Supply, Inc. 3816 Binz Engleman, B101 San Antonio, TX 78219 Pasadena, TX 77503	Enz USA, Inc. 1585 Beverly Ct - Unit 115 Aurora, IL 60502	Aries Industries, Inc.
7.	10 ea. Bulldog, Antiblast Nozzles, 1 Inch, Application Range 9.8" – 23.5", Minimum GPM at 1450 psi at the nozzle: 53, Rotating Nozzles, Front Jet and Thrust Jet: 6 X M10 Dimensions (inches): 5.1 X 10, Weight (lb): 17, Maximum Pressure (psi): 1,160. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 600.100A or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 43941) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	4,392.00 43,920.00 Enz 600.100A	4,538.40 45,384.00 Enz 600.100	4,880.00 48,800.00	NO BID
8.	2 ea. Bulldozer, 1" connection, for 12" to 60" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 6.3" high x 5.9" wide x 17.32" long, weight to be 53 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 6 thrust/cleaning jets, 2 fan jets (for cleaning the walls), 1 optional front jet, live swivel at the hose connection, hardened adjustable skis. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 50.100 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34724) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	4,410.00 8,820.00 Enz 50.100G	4,557.00 9,114.00 Enz 50.100G	4,900.00 9,800.00	
9.	2 ea. Chain Scraper, 1" connection, for 6-10" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 5.3" to 9.3" diameter x 17.1" long, weight to be 30 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 3 rotating jets and 3 thrust jets. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 10.150R or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34725) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	4,725.00 9,450.00 Enz 10.150RL	4,882.50 9,765.00 Enz 10.150RL	5,250.00 10,500.00	
10.	5 ea. Chain Scraper, 1" connection, for 8"-16" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 7.3" to 15" diameter x 21.6" long, weight to be 45 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 3 rotating jets and 3 thrust jets. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 10.200R or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34726) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	7,582.50 37,912.50 Enz 10.200R	7,835.25 39,176.25 Enz 10.200R	8,425.00 42,125.00	
11.	2 ea. Chain Scraper, 1" connection, for 16"-32" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 15" to 31" diameter x 24.6" long, weight to be 103 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 3 rotating jets and 3 thrust jets. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 10.400R or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34727) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	10,260.00 20,520.00 Enz 10.400R	10,602.00 21,204.00 Enz 10.400R	11,400.00 22,800.00	

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2018

CLS Sewer Equipment Co., Inc.
 726 S. Sherman St.
 Richardson, TX 75081

Kinloch Equipment & Supply,
 Inc.
 3816 Binz Engleman, B101
 San Antonio, TX 78219
 Pasadena, TX 77503

Enz USA, Inc.
 1585 Beverly Ct - Unit 115
 Aurora, IL 60502

Aries Industries, Inc.

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY				
12.	10 ea. Flounder, 1"connection, for 12"-24" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 2.4"high x 6.3" wide x 11.8" long, weight to be 27.1 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 8 thrust jets, 2 at 15o, 2 at 7.5o and 4 at 0o. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 70.100 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34728)	UNIT			
		PRICE	1,440.00	1,488.00	1,600.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	14,400.00 Enz 70.100	14,880.00 Enz 70.100	16,000.00
13.	1 ea. Ejector, 1"connection, for 10"-20" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 4.35" high X 6.3" wide X 7.6" long, weight to be 20 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 6 thrust jets. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 80.100 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34729)	UNIT			
		PRICE	3,825.00	3,952.50	4,250.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	3,825.00 Enz 80.100	3,952.50 Enz 80.100	4,250.00
14.	1 ea. Ejector, 1"connection, for 16"-60" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 10" high X 12.8" wide X 19.6" long, weight to be 37 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 6 thrust jets. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 80.100A or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34730)	UNIT			
		PRICE	5,395.50	5,575.35	5,995.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	5,395.50 Enz 80.100A	5,575.35 Enz 80.100A	5,995.00
15.	15 ea. Bulldog, 1"connection, for 5"-16" diameter pipes, 80 gpm at 2000 psi, dimensions to be 3.9" diameter X 8.9" long, weight to be 8.6 lbs, winglet ceramic lined replaceable jets (guaranteed for 5 years against wear), 6 thrust jets, 5 rotating jets and 1 forward jet. Included with each nozzle, a 6" Bulldog skid to allow for the option to clean 8"-18" pipe. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 400.080 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34731)	UNIT			
		PRICE	3,060.00	3,162.00	3,400.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	45,900.00 Enz 404.080 H5150	47,430.00 Enz 404.080 H5150	51,000.00
	TOTAL GROUP 1	TOTAL	244,467.00	244,757.40	271,630.00
	Manufacturer		Enz	Enz	Enz USA, Inc.
	Price Sheet		2018 Enz Price List	Included in Quote	Attached-Jan. 1, 2019
	Date		11/26/18	2/2018	Jan. 1, 2019 to Dec. 31, 2019
	Discount		10%	7%	

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2018

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

CLS Sewer Equipment Co., Inc.
 726 S. Sherman St.
 Richardson, TX 75081

Kinloch Equipment & Supply,
 Inc.
 3816 Binz Engleman, B101
 San Antonio, TX 78219
 Pasadena, TX 77503

Enz USA, Inc.
 1585 Beverly Ct - Unit 115
 Aurora, IL 60502

Aries Industries, Inc.

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	CLS Sewer Equipment Co., Inc.	Kinloch Equipment & Supply, Inc.	Enz USA, Inc.
GROUP 2 - ACCESSORIES AND WEAR ITEMS					
1.	14 ea. Toolbox made of shock-resistant plastic that can withstand high and low temperatures; locking kit box to hold all 1 each of Group 1, Items 1-5 above and tools; tools to include a complete set of nut drivers, tip cleaning kit, and Loctite for nozzle/tool maintenance; foam cutouts for nozzles and tools to be included. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 09.004 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34732) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	292.50 4,095.00 Enz 09.004	302.25 4,231.50 Enz 09.004	325.00 4,550.00
2.	5 yards Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the Yard. For use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.150R Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.150G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34733) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	81.00 405.00 Enz 0010.150G	83.70 418.50 Enz 0010.150G	90.00 450.00
3.	2 yards Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the Yard. For use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R and 10.400R Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34734) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	90.90 181.80 Enz 12G	93.93 187.86 Enz 10.400R	101.00 202.00
4.	5 sets 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 6” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.150R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.150150G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34735) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	157.50 787.50 Enz 00.150150G	162.75 813.75 Enz 00.150150G	175.00 875.00
5.	5 sets 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 8” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.150R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.150200G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34736) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	162.00 810.00 Enz 0010.150200G	167.40 837.00 Enz 0010.150200G	180.00 900.00
6.	5 sets 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 10” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.150R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.150250G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34737) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	166.50 832.50 Enz 0010.150250G	172.05 860.25 Enz 0010.150250G	185.00 925.00

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2018

CLS Sewer Equipment Co., Inc.
 726 S. Sherman St.
 Richardson, TX 75081

Kinloch Equipment & Supply,
 Inc.
 3816 Binz Engleman, B101
 San Antonio, TX 78219
 Pasadena, TX 77503

Enz USA, Inc.
 1585 Beverly Ct - Unit 115
 Aurora, IL 60502

Aries Industries, Inc.

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY				
7.	3 sets 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 8” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.200G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34738) Make and Model quoting	UNIT			
		PRICE	254.70	263.19	283.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	764.10 Enz 12.200G	789.57 Enz 12.200G	849.00
8.	2 sets 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 10” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.250G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34739) Make and Model quoting	UNIT			
		PRICE	272.60	282.72	304.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	545.20 Enz 12.250G	565.44 Enz 12.250G	608.00
9.	5 sets 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 12” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.300G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34740) Make and Model quoting	UNIT			
		PRICE	273.60	282.72	304.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	1,368.00 Enz 12.300G	1,413.60 Enz 12.300G	1,520.00
10.	3 sets 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 14” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.350G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34741) Make and Model quoting	UNIT			
		PRICE	297.00	306.90	330.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	891.00 Enz 12.350G	920.70 Enz 12.350G	990.00
11.	5 sets 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 16” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.401G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34742) Make and Model quoting	UNIT			
		PRICE	297.00	306.90	330.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	1,485.00 Enz 12.401G	1,534.50 Enz 12.401G	1,650.00
12.	1 set 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 16” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.400R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.402G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34743) Make and Model quoting	UNIT			
		PRICE	273.60	282.72	304.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	273.60 Enz 12.402G	282.72 Enz 12.402G	304.00
13.	1 set 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 18” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.400R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.450G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34744) Make and Model quoting	UNIT			
		PRICE	297.00	306.90	330.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	297.00 Enz 12.450G	306.90 Enz 12.450G	330.00
14.	1 set 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 20” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.400R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.500G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34745) Make and Model quoting	UNIT			
		PRICE	297.00	306.90	330.00
		TOTAL Make/Model	297.00 Enz 12.500G	306.90 Enz 12.500G	330.00

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2018

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

			CLS Sewer Equipment Co., Inc. 726 S. Sherman St. Richardson, TX 75081	Kinloch Equipment & Supply, Inc. 3816 Binz Engleman, B101 San Antonio, TX 78219 Pasadena, TX 77503	Enz USA, Inc. 1585 Beverly Ct - Unit 115 Aurora, IL 60502	Aries Industries, Inc.
15.	1 set 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 24” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.400R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.600G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34746) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	329.40 329.40 Enz 12.600G	340.78 340.78 Enz 12.600G	366.00 366.00	NO BID
16.	1 set 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 28” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.400R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.700G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34747) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	351.90 351.90 Enz 12.700G	363.63 363.63 Enz 12.700G	391.00 391.00	
17.	1 set 1 Set Pin bolt Chain – Sold by the set. 32” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.400R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 12.800G or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34748) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	375.30 375.30 Enz 12.800G	387.81 387.81 Enz 12.800G	417.00 417.00	
18.	1 set 1 Set chain with bracket – Sold by the set. For use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.150R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.1508R or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34749) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	99.00 99.00 Enz 0010.1508R	102.30 102.30 Enz 0010.1508R	110.00 110.00	
19.	1 set 1 Set chain with bracket – Sold by the set. For use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R or 10.400R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.2008R or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34750) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	120.60 120.60 Enz 0010.2008R	124.62 124.62 Enz 0010.2008R	134.00 134.00	
20.	2 ea. Diamond Crown, 6” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.150R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.150D or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34751) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	990.00 1,980.00 Enz 0010.150D	1,023.00 2,046.00 Enz 0010.150D	1,100.00 2,200.00	
21.	5 ea. Diamond Crown, 8” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.150R or 10.200R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.200D or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34752) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	1,890.00 9,450.00 Enz 0010.200D	1,953.00 9,765.00 Enz 0010.200D	2,100.00 10,500.00	
22.	5 ea. Diamond Crown, 10” for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.250D or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34753) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	2,182.50 10,912.50 Enz 0010.250D	2,255.25 11,276.25 Enz 0010.25D	2,425.00 12,125.00	

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2018

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	CL S Sewer Equipment Co., Inc. 726 S. Sherman St. Richardson, TX 75081	Kinloch Equipment & Supply, Inc. 3816 Binz Engleman, B101 San Antonio, TX 78219 Pasadena, TX 77503	Enz USA, Inc. 1585 Beverly Ct - Unit 115 Aurora, IL 60502	Aries Industries, Inc.
23.	5 ea. Diamond Crown, 12" for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.300D or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34754) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE	3,240.00	3,348.00	3,600.00	NO BID
		TOTAL Make/Model	16,200.00 Enz 0010.300D	16,740.00 Enz 0010.300D	18,000.00	
24.	1 ea. Center Head, 8"-16" for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.200R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.2004R or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34755) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE	1,687.50	1,743.75	1,875.00	
		TOTAL Make/Model	1,687.50 Enz 0010.2004R	1,743.75 Enz 0010.2004R	1,875.00	
25.	1 ea. Center Head, 16"-32" for use with Enz Wire Rope and Chain Scraper Model 10.400R. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 0010.4004R or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34756) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE	1,971.00	2,036.70	2,190.00	
		TOTAL Make/Model	1,971.00 Enz 0010.4004R	2,036.70 Enz 0010.4004R	2,190.00	
26.	10 ea. JetMax ceramic round jet, Size 0mm and 0.5mm-3.0mm in increments of 0.1mm. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 22.06 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34757) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE	24.30	25.11	27.00	
		TOTAL Make/Model	243.00 Enz 22.06	251.10 Enz 22.06	270.00	
27.	10 ea. JetMax ceramic round jet, Size 0mm and 1.0mm-3.0mm in increments of 0.1mm, and 3.2mm, 3.4mm. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 22.08 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34758) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE	26.10	26.97	29.00	
		TOTAL Make/Model	261.00 Enz 22.08	269.70 Enz 22.08	290.00	
28.	5 ea. JetMax ceramic round jet, Size 0mm and 1.0mm-3.0mm in increments of 0.1mm, and 3.2mm, 3.4mm, 3.6mm, 3.8mm, 4.0mm. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 22.10 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34759) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE	29.00	30.69	33.00	
		TOTAL Make/Model	145.00 Enz 22.10	153.45 Enz 22.10	165.00	
29.	3 ea. JetMax ceramic round jet, Size 0mm and 1.0mm-3.0mm in increments of 0.1mm, and 3.2mm, 3.4mm, 3.6mm, 3.8mm, 4.0mm. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 22.025 or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34760) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE	29.70	30.69	33.00	
		TOTAL Make/Model	89.10 Enz 22.025	92.07 Enz 22.025	99.00	
30.	3 ea. FanJet ceramic flat jet, Size 0mm and 1.0mm (=1.1mm round jet) and 1.5mm (=1.6 round jet). Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 22.08F or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34761) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE	19.87	26.97	35.00	
		TOTAL Make/Model	59.61 Enz 22.08F	80.91 Enz 22.08F	105.00	

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2018

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

			CLS Sewer Equipment Co., Inc. 726 S. Sherman St. Richardson, TX 75081	Kinloch Equipment & Supply, Inc. 3816 Binz Engleman, B101 San Antonio, TX 78219 Pasadena, TX 77503	Enz USA, Inc. 1585 Beverly Ct - Unit 115 Aurora, IL 60502	Aries Industries, Inc.
31.	3 ea. FanJet ceramic flat jet, Size 0mm and 1.0mm (=1.1mm round jet), 1.5mm (=1.6 round jet), 1.9mm (=2.1 round jet), 2.2mm (=2.4mm round jet), 2.5mm (=2.7mm round jet), and 2.8mm (=3.0mm round jet) Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 22.10F or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34762) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	34.20 102.60 Enz 22.10F	35.34 106.02 Enz 22.10F	38.00 114.00	NO BID
32.	2 ea. Socket Wrench, 3.5mm for replacing M4 jet inserts. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 09.0935U or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34763) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	17.10 34.20 Enz 09.0935U	17.67 35.34 Enz 09.0935U	19.00 38.00	
33.	2 ea. Socket Wrench, 5.0mm for replacing M6 jet inserts. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 09.095U or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34764) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	17.10 34.20 Enz 09.095U	17.67 35.34 Enz 09.095U	19.00 38.00	
34.	2 ea. Socket Wrench, 7.0mm for replacing M8 jet inserts. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 09.097U or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34765) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	18.00 36.00 Enz 09.097U	23.25 46.50 Enz 09.097U	20.00 40.00	
35.	20 ea. Tip Cleaning Kit, for cleaning debris from jets. Mfg: Enz USA, Inc. p/n 09.500TC or approved equal (SAWS Item No. 34766) Make and Model quoting	UNIT PRICE TOTAL Make/Model	40.50 810.00 Enz C202	41.85 837.00 Enz C202	45.00 900.00	
	TOTAL GROUP 2	TOTAL	* 58,324.61	60,303.46	64,850.00	
	Manufacturer		Enz	Enz	Enz USA	
	Price Sheet		2018 Enz Price List	Included in Bid	Jan. 1, 2019 to Dec. 31, 2019	
	Date		11/26/18	2/2018	Jan. 1, 2019	
	Discount		10% Discount	7%		
	TOTAL AWARD		302,791.61			

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Sewer Cleaning Nozzles Plus Accessories and Wear Items
 TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2018
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

CLS Sewer Equipment Co., Inc.
 726 S. Sherman St.
 Richardson, TX 75081

Kinloch Equipment & Supply,
 Inc.
 3816 Binz Engleman, B101
 San Antonio, TX 78219
 Pasadena, TX 77503

Enz USA, Inc.
 1585 Beverly Ct - Unit 115
 Aurora, IL 60502

Aries Industries, Inc.

	EXTENSION 1		302,791.61			
	EXTENSION 2		302,791.61			
	EXTENSION 3		302,791.61			
	EXTENSION 4		302,791.61			
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	
	Delivery Days					

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Aries Industries
 Balar Equipment, Corp.
 CLS Sewer Equip. Co., Inc.
 Cobra Technologies
 Enz USA, Inc.
 Hose Power
 Hydraquip
 Kinloch Equipment & Supply

Pipe Hunter
 Professional Sewer Tools
 Sewer Tools
 Southland Tools
 SunSource
 Texas Municipal Equip.
 Texas Underground
 Trident Supply

Demandstar Website
 SAWS Website